BIDSHEET FOR 24TH E-AUCTION HELD ON 10/11/2020

Grade Grade as per Available Sale Value at Sheet
Sr.No T.C.No Lot No. Stack No Location Cargo Owner Declaration submittedBy DMG Anavlisis Type uantit Base Price Bidder Name Bid price Sold Qty Ld No. Auction Date Auction Timing Balance
party Price
Soc.Timblo
MR STACK 3- Government mstc/SEABIRD MARINE
1 35/55 MR STACK 3 Pale Mi 49 49.1 ROM 32,859.00 300.0 310 1000 310000 19050 | 11/10/2020 | 11:00:00- 12:02:21
/ 35/55 aie iine of Goa 'rm"(‘;’:,)“da SERVICES/127437 a0
{
et RO 300 31850 9555000 19050 | 11/10/2020 | 11:00:00- 12:02:22 9
RESOURCES/128537
Government | Sesa Resources mstc/SEABIRD MARINE
2 : i ' 55.45 56.24 10,313.00 500.0 11:00:00- 12:02:23 | 9,813.00
35/52 ROM 1 RIV-ROM 1 Rivona Mine ot T ROM ) SERVICES/127437 500 500 250000 19050 | 11/10/2020 )
G t | SesaR
3 35/52 ROM 2 ROM 2-35/52 | RivonaMine | ~OVernment | >esaResources 55.3 27.6 ROM 29,583.00 500.0 NO BID 0 0 0 29,583.00
of Goa Limited
G t | SesaR tc/SEABIRD MARINE
4 35/52 ROM 3 ROM3-35/52 | RivonaMine | ~OVernment | >esaResources 54.87 53.9 ROM 51,914.00 s000 | ™t 500 500 250000 19050 | 11/10/2020 | 11:00:00-12:02:23 | 51,414.00
of Goa Limited SERVICES/127437
G t | SesaR
5 35/52 ROM 4 ROM4-35/52 | RivonaMine | ~OVernment | >esaResources 53.2 54.37 ROM 9,373.00 500.0 NO BID 0 0 0 9,373.00
of Goa Limited
6 30/50 R1 R1-30/50 @l (i || S |l TR 48-50 38.55 ROM 23,044.00 500.0 ML EniE 500 5000 2500000 19050 | 11/10/2020 | 11:00:00- 12:02:23
of Goa Hede Limited/70252
mstc/KALINGA ALLIED
1 1 11/10/202 11:00:00- 12:02:23 |  17,944.00
e —— 500 00 50000 9050 /10/2020
. Government
7 76/52 ROM_1 ROM 1-76/52 | Advaplae Mine g Sesa Goa Ltd 54.11 49.52 ROM 1,097.00 500.0 NO BID 0 0 0 1,097.00
[e) 0a
. Government | Chowgule & Co
8 31/55 R-3 R-3-31/55 | Gavanem Mines 515 39.42 ROM 3,548.00 500.0 NO BID 0 0 0 3,548.00
of Goa Pvt. Ltd
Rajaram
G t tc/AMIT
9 04/49 10 10-4/49 Sirigao Mine | Sovernment | Bandekar 45 44.52 ROM 10,500.00 300.0 mstc/. 300 10000 3000000 19050 | 11/10/2020 | 11:00:00- 12:02:23 500.00
of Goa (Sirgao) Mines EARTHMOVERS/74478
Pvt Ltd
. Government V.G. Quenim
10 16/55 21 R21-16/55 | Sonus Onvalim 36.85 37 ROM 5,600.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 5,600.00
of Goa (Late)
11 16/55 27 R27-16/55 | Sonus Onvalim Govirgme”t V'Gf:e)”'m 38.94 39 ROM 22,488.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 22,488.00
[e) oa ate
1 | 3/5733/5719/54 R15 RIS-KUNDA | Fatiem/Tudou | Government | -\ g Ghorse 45-48 4835 ROM 170,785.00 300.0 mstc/Timblo 300 5000 1500000 19050 | 11/10/2020 | 11:00:00-12:02:21 | 165,785.00
42/56 Mine of Goa Enterprises/74379
13 | 3/5733/5719/54 R16 R16-KUNDA | 2tiem/Tudou | Government |\ o ¢ Gharse 45-47 43.79 ROM 24,165.00 300.0 mstc/Timblo 300 500 150000 19050 | 11/10/2020 | 11:00:00- 12:02:22 | 23,665.00
42/56 Mine of Goa Enterprises/74379
14 | 3/5733/5719/54 R17A R17A-KUNDA | Patiem/Tudou | Government |, 0 o porce 42-46 40.63 ROM 25,745.00 300.0 mstc/Timblo 300 500 150000 19050 | 11/10/2020 | 11:00:00- 12:02:23 | 25,245.00
42/56 Mine of Goa Enterprises/74379
15 | 3/5733/5719/54 R18 R1s-KUNDA | "atiem/Tudou | Government |\ ¢ Gharse 40-45 42.96 ROM 49,600.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 49,600.00
42/56 Mine of Goa
Government mstc/PROVIDENCE
16 92/52 R1 R1-92/52 Dignem Mine T om e | Timblo Pyt Ltd 4552 47.23 ROM 1,882.00 500.0 REALTY AND 500 10 5000 19051 | 11/10/2020 | 12:06:00-14:03:53 1,872.00
RESOURCES LLP/166016
Government mstc/V M Salgaocar
17 45/54 STACK R1R STACK R1R-45/54 |  Vagus Jetty of Goa Sova 48.5 48.63 ROM 15,000.00 300.0 and Brother Private 990 15000 14850000 19051 11/10/2020 12:06:00-14:03:53 0.00
Limited/59027
18 45/54 STACKR3R | STACKR3R-45/54 | Vagusletty | covernment Sova 485 46.11 ROM 42,629.00 300.0 ki U L 770 20000 15400000 | 19051 | 11/10/2020 | 12:06:00-14:03:53
of Goa Limited/70252
mstc/PROVIDENCE
REALTY AND 760 22620 17191200 | 19051 | 11/10/2020 | 12:06:00-14:03:53 9
RESOURCES LLP/166016
Joleracho Government Shantilal
19 44/51 RSTACK 1 RSTACK 1-44/51 Khusaldas & 48-50 50 ROM 25,440.00 500.0 NO BID 0 0 0 25,440.00
Dongor of Goa
Bros Pvt Ltd
Pratham
LG/ROM/1A- Chunimol G t
20 28/52 LG/ROM/1 /ROM/ unimoio OVernMent | pesources Pvt 46 46 ROM 1,109.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 1,109.00
28/52 Mines of Goa .
Ltd/Shantilal
Pratham
LG/ROM/1B- Chunimol G t
21 28/52 LG/ROM/1 /ROM/ unimoio OVernMeNt | pesources Pvt 495 50 ROM 1,917.00 500.0 NO BID 0 0 0 1,917.00
28/52 Mines of Goa .
Ltd/Shantilal
Chunimol G t | Kadnek tc/AMIT
2 75/52 6 R 6-75/52 -nunimolo overnmen adnekar 51.04 52 ROM 16,382.00 500.0 T 510 5000 2550000 19051 | 11/10/2020 | 12:06:00-14:03:53
Mines, Rivona of Goa Vaicunth EARTHMOVERS/74478




mstc/SEABIRD MARINE

:06:00-14:03: 10,382.
i 500 1000 500000 19051 | 11/10/2020 | 12:06:00-14:03:53 0,382.00
23 12/53 7 R 7-12/53 Bategal Mines, | Government | Kadnekar 4524 46 ROM 1,092.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 1,092.00
Maina of Goa Vaicunth
Kotambi Government Bandekar mstc/KODEE
24 84/52 VI-D VI-D-84/52 4337 48.17 ROM 150,000.00 300.0 310 2000 620000 19051 | 11/10/2020 | 12:06:00-14:03:53
/ / Jetty/Plot of Goa Brothers Pvt Ltd RESOURCES/128537 e
mstc/AMIT
1 2 2 19051 | 11/10/202 12:06:00-14:03:
EARTHMOVERS 74478 | 310 000 620000 905 /10/2020 06:00-14:03:53
mstc/V M Salgaocar
and Brother Private 300 15000 4500000 19051 | 11/10/2020 | 12:06:00-14:03:53
Limited/59027
mstc/SEABIRD MARINE
1 19051 | 11/10/202 12:06:00-14:03: 121,000.00
i 300 0000 3000000 905 /10/2020 06:00-14:03:53
t | Bandek
25 84/52 VAG-ROM1 VGS/R-1-84/52 | VagusStack | COVernmen andekar 43.74 41.99 ROM 196,366.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 196,366.00
of Goa Brothers Pvt Ltd
. Government Bandekar
26 84/52 2 2-84/52 Pale Mine 46.54 28.53 ROM 175,425.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 175,425.00
of Goa Brothers Pvt Ltd
Baddrudin
Colomba / Government mstc/KODEE
27 14/52 R-1 R-1-14/52 ArTsfier 48-55% 49 ROM 68,089.00 500.0 520 2000 1040000 19051 | 11/10/2020 | 12:06:00-14:03:53
/ / Sulcorna Mine|  of Goa BT e ° RESOURCES/128537 A
Mavani
mstc/AMIT
2 1 2 19051 | 11/10/202 12:06:00-14:03: 65,089.00
EARTHMOVERS 74478 | 520 000 520000 905 /10/2020 06:00-14:03:53
28 08/50 R-1 R1-08/50 |Fatiem/Uguem| Government oo oo inkar|  35-40% 48.16 ROM 32,698.00 300.0 mstc/Vedanta 300 32690 9807000 19051 | 11/10/2020 | 12:06:00-14:03:53 8.00
Mine of Goa Limited/70252
29 02/57 R8&RY R8 &R 9-02/57 | Muuli/ Costi | Government | Mahablwshwar 48.59 48.59 ROM 13,800.00 3000 | Mstc/Avishashipping | o, 13800 10350000 19051 | 11/10/2020 | 12:06:00-14:03:53 0.00
Mine of Goa Garco corporation/145549
Soc.Timblo
ROM STACK 1- Government mstc/KODEE
30 87/53 ROM STACK 1 Shigao Mi 46.13 53.07 LUMPS 24,510.00 500.0 500 10000 5000000 19051 | 11/10/2020 | 12:06:00-14:03:53 | 14,510.00
/ 87/53 'gao Mine of Goa 'rm?;’:_)“da RESOURCES/128537 /10/
|
Soc.Timblo
MR STACK (A&B)-
31 87/53 MR STACK (A&B) S 87C/5§ Bl | shigao Mine Goz‘:rgge"t Irmaos Ltda 42.39 43.48 FINES 47,956.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 47,956.00
(Pti)
Government | Dr. PrafullaR mstc/PROVIDENCE
Vi . u
32 30/50 T T Maina Jetty o oo 48-50 48-50 FINES 1,652.00 500.0 REALTY AND 500 1650 825000 19053 | 11/10/2020 | 13:00:00-14:00:23 2.00
RESOURCES LLP/166016
ore purchased
howgul v
33 from 07/41 & F3 F3-EMCO Mpd Jetty | covernment | Chowgule & Co 44 44 FINES 45,630.00 300.0 mstc/Vedanta 300 45630 13689000 19053 | 11/10/2020 | 13:00:00-14:00:23 0.00
of Goa Pvt. Ltd Limited/70252
23/53
34 23/53 F2 EMCO-F2 Bimbol Mines | GOVernment | Emco Goa Pvt 44 44.51 FINES 68,584.00 300.0 mstc/Vedanta 300 68580 20574000 19053 | 11/10/2020 | 13:00:00-14:00:23 4.00
of Goa Ltd Limited/70252
35 16/55 20 SONUS-20 | Sonus Onvalim | Government | V.G. Quenim 38.19 39.80 LUMPS 2,100.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 2,100.00
of Goa (Late)
36 16/55 24 24-16/55 Sonus Onvalim | overnment | V.G. Quenim 43.23 45.84 FINES 1,700.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 1,700.00
of Goa (Late)
37 16/55 27A R-27-16/55 | Sonus Onvalim | overnment | V.G.Quenim 38.94 42.39 FINES 46,272.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 46,272.00
of Goa (Late)
38 16/55 278 27A-16/55 | Sonus Onvalim | Sovernment | V.G.Quenim 38.94 38.94 LUMPS 21,740.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 21,740.00
of Goa (Late)
92/52 PURCHASED G t Timbl tc/AMIT
39 / F1 F1.92/52 Maina Jetty overnmen imbolo 465 465 FINES 34,972.00 300.0 mstc/ 300 2000 600000 19053 | 11/10/2020 | 13:00:00-14:00:23 | 32,972.00
FROM of Goa Enterprises EARTHMOVERS/74478
33/57, 19/54 ] .
' g G t Timbl tc/Timbl
40 | 42/56,5/53,8/50 FSA FSA-TIMBLO | Tollem Plant | —OvSmmen imbolo 48 4938 FINES 1,068.00 300.0 mstc/Timblo 300 500 150000 19053 | 11/10/2020 | 13:00:00-14:00:23 568.00
of Goa Enterprises Enterprises/74379
8 68/53
33/57,19/54, Government Timblo mstc/Timblo
41 | 42/56,5/53,8/50 F5B FSB-TIMBLO | Tollem Plant : 46 46.02 FINES 2,348.00 300.0 / 300 500 150000 19053 | 11/10/2020 | 13:00:00-14:00:23 | 1,848.00
of Goa Enterprises Enterprises/74379
8 68/53
33/57,19/54, Government Timblo mstc/Timblo
42 | 42/56,5/53,8/50 F5C FSC-TIMBLO | Tollem Plant _ 46 44.61 FINES 2,230.00 300.0 / 300 500 150000 19053 | 11/10/2020 | 13:00:00-14:00:23 |  1,730.00
of Goa Enterprises Enterprises/74379
& 68/53
33/57, 19/54 i
: : G t Timbl tc/SEABIRD MARINE
43 | 42/56,5/53,8/50 F5D FSD-TIMBLO | TollemPlant | oo me'e a8 50.60 FINES 3,488.00 so00 | ™ 500 1000 500000 | 19053 | 11/10/2020 | 13:00:00-14:00:23
of Goa Enterprises SERVICES/127437
8.68/53
mstc/Timblo 500 100 50000 19053 | 11/10/2020 | 13:00:00-14:00:23 |  2,388.00

Enterprises/74379




44 14/52 & 19/54 F3 F3(CAUR)-TIMBLO| Caurem Plant | OVernment Timblo 47 47 FINES 36,500.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 36,500.00
of Goa Enterprises
45 75/52 5 F5(M)-75/52 Chunimolo | Government |  Kadnekar 47.84 47.84 FINES 9,820.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 9,820.00
Mines, Rivona of Goa Vaicunth
Chunimolo Government Kadnekar mstc/SEABIRD MARINE
46 75/52 7 F7(M)-75/52 50.74 50.74 FINES 10,439.00 500.0 520 500 260000 19054 | 11/10/2020 |14:00:00-16:56:11.95
/ (il Mines, Rivona of Goa Vaicunth SERVICES/127437 /8]
mstc/Avisha shipping
> 510 9930 5064300 19054 | 11/10/2020 |14:00:00-16:56:11.95 9.00
corporation/145549
47 75/52 8 8-75/52 Chunimolo | Government |  Kadnekar 44.44 45.00 FINES 4,374.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 4,374.00
Mines, Rivona of Goa Vaicunth
Kotamb G t | Bandek
48 84/52 I-A I-A-84/52 otamoy overnmen andekar 46.16 44.05 FINES 4,843.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 4,843.00
Jetty/Plot of Goa Brothers Pvt Ltd
Kotamb Government Bandekar R GHOMIDEREE
49 84/52 IE 2 I-E 2-84/52 it /Plg’t o | oo ot Lt 4821 4821 FINES 21,099.00 300.0 REALTY AND 360 16099 5795640 19054 | 11/10/2020 |14:00:00-16:56:11.95
¥ RESOURCES LLP/166016
SR 360 5000 1800000 19054 | 11/10/2020 |14:00:00-16:56:11.95 0.00
IMPEX/127305
50 02/57 5 6-02/57 Muguli / Costi | Government | Mahablwshwar | .\ cco 4558 FINES 14,500.00 500.0 mstc/Vedanta 500 14500 7250000 19054 | 11/10/2020 |14:00:00-16:56:11.95 0.00
Mine of Goa Garco Limited/70252
51 02/57 6 7-02/57 Muguli/ Costi. | Government | Mahablwshwar | o\ oo, 40.72 FINES 23,300.00 500.0 mstc/Vedanta 500 15000 7500000 19054 | 11/10/2020 [14:00:00-16:56:11.95|  8,300.00
Mine of Goa Garco Limited/70252
52 02/57 7 10-02/57 Muguli / Costi | Government | Mahablwshwar | .\ cco 38.29 FINES 2,200.00 500.0 NO BID 0 0 0 2,200.00
Mine of Goa Garco
Monte Iranqui . .
MONTE-ROM Government Shri Zacarias mstc/DHANLAXMI
53 55/53 ROM STACK 1 i 49.14 48.95 Fi 120,000.00 300.0 1350 120000 162000000 | 19054 | 11/10/2020 |14:00:00-16:56:11.95 0.00
/ STACK 1 Mine ,Potrem of Goa Antao (Late) ines ENTERPRISES/166101 /10/
Sanguem
Government Sunanda D i OIS
54 62A/52 | KOT-R-1 Kothambi Plant | ~° 107" oot 48 48 Rom 43,000.00 300.0 REALTY AND 330 20000 6600000 19054 | 11/10/2020 |14:00:00-16:56:11.95
RESOURCES LLP/166016
RS 330 4000 1320000 19054 | 11/10/2020 |14:00:00-16:56:11.95
IMPEX/127305
i EER 320 19000 6080000 19054 | 11/10/2020 |14:00:00-16:56:11.95 0.00
Limited/70252
Kotambi G t | Bandek tc/SEABIRD MARINE
55 84/52 VI-C VI-C-84/52 otambl overnmen andekar 41.32 48.07 ROM 100,000.00 3000 |™t 310 500 155000 19054 | 11/10/2020 |14:00:00-16:56:11.95
Jetty/Plot of Goa Brothers Pvt Ltd SERVICES/127437
mstc/V M Salgaocar
and Brother Private 300 80000 24000000 | 19054 | 11/10/2020 |14:00:00-16:56:11.95 19,500.00
Limited/59027
G t | Bandek
56 84/52 1-PALE 1-84/52 Pale Mine overnmen andekar 47.65 30.12 ROM 100,000.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 100,000.00
of Goa Brothers Pvt Ltd
G t | Bandek
57 84/52 1-SHELP SHEL-1-84/52 | Shelpem Plot | JOVermmen andekar 46.16 46 ROM 100,000.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 100,000.00
of Goa Brothers Pvt Ltd
58 68/53 RI RI-68/53 Uguem Mine | GOvernment Vicente 48-50% 57.74 ROM 1,000.00 500.0 NO BID 0 0 0 1,000.00
of Goa Fernandes
59 16/55 15 15-16/55 Sonus Onvalim | overnment | V.G. Quenim 47.70 18.60 FINES 1,100.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 1,100.00
of Goa (Late)
60 16/55 25 25-16/55 Sonus Onvalim | overnment | V.G. Quenim 34.10 36.36 FINES 1,100.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 1,100.00
of Goa (Late)
61 02/57 8 11-02/57 Muguli/ Costi | Government | Mahablwshwar | o\ ccoc 45.11 FINES 6,000.00 500.0 mstc/Vedanta 500 6000 3000000 19055 | 11/10/2020 | 15:00:00-17:09:35 0.00
Mine of Goa Garco Limited/70252
62 17/49 1 1-17/49 Near Balaj pits | SOvernment AX.Poi 48.00 50.86 Lumps 5,000.00 500.0 NO BID 0 0 0 5,000.00
of Goa Palondicar
63 17/49 2 2-17/49 Near Balaji pits | SOVernment AX.Poi 48.00 46.86 FINES 5,000.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 5,000.00
of Goa Palondicar
64 16/55 1 1-16/55 Cudnem plot | overnment | V.G. Quenim 46.83 48.72 FINES 17,813.00 300.0 mstc/FRIENDS 300 2000 600000 19055 | 11/10/2020 | 15:00:00-17:09:35 | 15,813.00
of Goa (Late) IMPEX/127305
Soc.Timblo
MR STACK 4- G t
65 35/55 MR STACK 4 3555 Pale Mine O:';rgz;en Irmaos Ltda 48 40.69 ROM 58,848.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 58,848.00
(Pti)
66 92/52 F1 F1-92/52 Dignem Plant | GOVernment Timblo 46.5 44.82 FINES 3,345.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 3,345.00
of Goa Enterprises
67 12/53 10 BATEG-10 Bategal Mines, | Government | Kadnekar 50.84 50.84 FINES 13,210.00 500.0 NO BID 0 0 0 13,210.00
Maina of Goa Vaicunth
Government | Emco Goa Pvt mstc/Vedanta
68 10,000.00 500.0 500 10000 5000000 19055 | 11/10/2020 | 15:00:00-17:09:35 0.00
7/41 23/53 R3 R3-EMCO Bimbol Mines of Goa Ltd 45 50 ROM Limited/70252 /10/




69 Bategal Mines, | Government Kadnekar 2 632.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 2 632.00
12/53 4 L4(M)-12/53 Maina of Goa Vaicunth 47.94 47.94 LUMPS ! ) ) ! )
EABIRD MARINE
70 83/52,19/58 & Government | V.M.Salgaocar 8,269.00 300.0 ms;:fVICES/127437 390 500 195000 19055 11/10/2020 15:00:00-17:09:35
50/53 P1A P1A-VMSB Vagus Plant of Goa & Bros Pvt Ltd 45.50 48.67 ROM
SR 380 7760 2948800 | 19055 | 11/10/2020 | 15:00:00-17:09:35 9.00
Limited/70252
71 Kotambi Government Bandekar 10,000.00 300.0 NO BID 0 0 0 10,000.00
84/52 VI-A VI-A-84/52 Jetty/Plot of Goa Brothers Pvt Ltd 44.3 43.58 ROM
mstc/V M Salgaocar
72 Government | Sallitho Ores 33,000.00 500.0 and Brother Private 940 13000 12220000 19055 11/10/2020 15:00:00-17:09:35
86/53 STACK R2 STACK R2-86/53 Pale Mine of Goa Pvt Ltd 50 50.13 ROM Limited/59027
mstc/Vaibhavi Shipping
930 20000 18600000 19055 11/10/2020 15:00:00-17:09:35 0.00
Pvt Ltd/128573 {0
mstc/PROVIDENCE
73 . 51,519.00 500.0 REALTY AND 510 10000 5100000 19055 11/10/2020 15:00:00-17:09:35 41,519.00
Government | Sallitho Ores RESOURCES LLP/166016
86/53 STACK R1 STACK R1-86/53 Pale Mine of Goa Pvt Ltd 50 43.58 ROM
mstc/PROVIDENCE
74 61,316.00 500.0 REALTY AND 1190 20000 23800000 19055 11/10/2020 15:00:00-17:09:35
Government | Chowgule & Co RESOURCES LLP/166016
5/49 13/49 R3 SIRIG-R3 Sirigao Plant of Goa Pvt. Ltd 51.5 52 ROM
mstc/AMIT
1 15:00:00-17:09: d
EARTHMOVERS/74478 1170 41310 48332700 9055 11/10/2020 5:00:00 09:35 6.00
. mstc/AMIT
75 Kotambi Government Bandekar 62,000.00 300.0 EARTHMOVERS,/74478 310 2000 620000 19055 11/10/2020 15:00:00-17:09:35
84/52 VI-B VI-B-84/52 Jetty/Plot of Goa Brothers Pvt Ltd 43.74 47.61 ROM
mstc/V M Salgaocar
and Brother Private 300 20000 6000000 19055 11/10/2020 15:00:00-17:09:35 40,000.00
Limited/59027
3/57 33/57 19/54 Patiem / Tudou | Government
76 42/56 R10 R10-KUNDA Mine of Goa Kunda R Gharse 45-50 45.93 ROM 91,136.00 >00.0 NO BID 0 0 0 91,136.00
3/57 33/57 19/54 Patiem / Tudou | Government mstc/Timblo
77 128,575.00 300.0 310 39500 12245000 19055 11/10/2020 15:00:00-17:09:35
42/56 R14 R14-KUNDA Mine of Goa Kunda R Gharse 35-40 48.72 ROM Enterprises/74379 /10/
U s 300 89070 26721000 | 19055 | 11/10/2020 | 15:00:00-17:09:35 5.00
Limited/70252
3/57 33/57 19/54 Patiem / Tudou | Government mstc/Timblo
78 142,650.00 500.0 510 40000 20400000 19055 11/10/2020 15:00:00-17:09:35
42/56 R9 R9-KUNDA Mine of Goa Kunda R Gharse 48-52 50.49 ROM Enterprises/74379 /10/
i e 500 102650 51325000 | 19055 | 11/10/2020 | 15:00:00-17:09:35 0.00
Limited/70252
Sociadade
. mstc/FRIENDS
79 Survey No Government | Timblo Irmaos 181,769.00 300.0 IMPEX/127305 310 2000 620000 19055 11/10/2020 15:00:00-17:09:35
14/53 R1 R1-14/53 146,Cudnem of Goa Ltda (Sfi) 46 49.15 ROM
mstc/Vedanta 300 50000 15000000 | 19055 | 11/10/2020 | 15:00:00-17:09:35 | 129,769.00
Limited/70252
80 F10 F10 MPT Government | Government of 58 58 FINES 3,459.00 500.0 NO BID 0 0 0 3,459.00
of Goa Goa
(in Million
(in Metric Tons) Metric Tons)
BALANCE 1,897,660.00 1.8977
SOLD 1,107,849.00 1.10785
PUT TO ACTION 3,005,509.00 3.00551




